
 

 

• Water Conservation 

• Noise Reduction 

• Extended Roof Life 

• Energy Conservation 

• LEED Certification 

• Urban Heat Island 

Mitigation 

• Storm Water Man-

agement 

• Fire Protection 

• Maximize Property 

Value 

• Tax Incentives 
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 Landcraft is now pro-
ducing plants specifically for 
Green Roofs. We have a large 
selection of hardy sedum and 
other plants suitable for roof in-
stallations. These hardy 
drought tolerant plants are cus-
tom grown in a quick draining, 
light weight soil mix which 
meets green roof specifications. 
Our plants are available in cus-
tom designed trays of 15 that 
can be planted with one variety 
or mixed to your specifications. 
The well grown mature plants 
are easily removed and in-
stalled to meet any custom 
planting plan design.  

Grow Design 

Maintain 

Install 

 Landcraft has been 
working on roof gardens since 
1982 and has vast resources to 
meet your Green Roof specifi-
cations. We can design your 
Green Roof to meet with spe-
cific design needs utilizing in-
tensive and extensive methods. 
We specialize in unique Hybrid 
Roof Systems that incorporate 
traditional garden esthetics 
with environmental sustainabil-
ity and both passive and recrea-
tional utilization of the outdoor 
space. Landcraft is distinct in 
that we grow, design, install, 
supervise and maintain Green 
Roofs.  

 Landcraft has on-staff 
and works with qualified and 
certified Green Roof techni-
cians that are able to install a 
variety of Green Roof systems. 

 We are able to provide a 
complete Green Roof package: 
from concept and design to 
growing and supplying plant 
material, installation and then 
maintaining your Green Roof . 


